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SLEIGH
TRACKS
Draw a path for Santa to 
deliver a present to every 
house. He cannot fly over a 
house or elf twice, or move 
diagonally. He starts with the 
number of presents given 
and must have an empty 
sleigh when visiting an elf to 
re-stock. He must visit one 
house with a mince pie & 
whisky before each re-stock, 
and during his final delivery 
leg, which must finish at the 
edge of the grid.

EIGHT
EVENTS
Each word or phrase is an 
anagram of a thematic term, 
seven of which have an extra 
letter which needs to be 
removed. The removed letters 
will spell out the one that's 
missing.

VERNIX
NON-RUDE

SHARDED
PEAR CORN

TELCOM
CARP END
HEINZ BLT

PC DUI

CRACKERS
Each cracker contained a seven-letter word, but the middle 

letter of each was lost when they were pulled. Work out which 
halves are from the same cracker, and rearrange the middle 

letters to work out what cheap gift they contained.
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